
6:17, 22; 7:4-5
God announces the 
coming flood. Noah 
obediently completes 
the building of the ark.

7:7, 10, 13-14
The flood begins and 
Noah enters the ark 
along with his family and 
the animals. 

7:11-12, 17
Rain falls and the depths 
burst open for 40 days 
and nights. Every living 
thing on the face of the 
earth is consumed.

7:24; 8:1-4
The flood remains 
for 150 days. The ark 
comes to rest on the 
mountains of Ararat.

8:5
The waters subside 
until the tops of the 
mountains become 
visible.

8:6-7 
Noah sends out a raven 
to scout for dry land.

8:8-9 
Noah sends out a dove. 
It returns to the ark 
without finding dry land.

8:10-11
Again Noah sends out 
the dove. This time it 
returns with an olive 
leaf.

8:12
Once more Noah sends 
out the dove. This time it 
does not return.

8:3
The waters fully subside 
from the earth.

8:13
Noah removes the 
covering of the ark, after 
the face of the earth 
begins to dry.

8:14-19
God commands Noah to 
leave the ark, after the 
earth becomes fully dry.
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